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Project manager travel



Lunch for the project meeting



Expert service



Reporting activities/ deliverables



Reporting project outputs/ 
programme output indicators



Q: One of your project partners asks: For the 
upcoming project summit, there was the idea 
to organise also an urban orienteering event. 
For that, we have planned to use an app by 
SuperAppProvider, as we have used it when 
participating in similar events. The price of the 
app is 1.600 € (with VAT 1.984 €) and the price 
per user is 30 € (with VAT 37,20 €) – estimated 
number of participants is 150. How should we 
proceed? 



A: As the total cost of the app is estimated to 
exceed 5.000 €, you need to make a price 
comparison and documented it properly. At 
least three comparable offers should be 
requested so that at least two offers can be 
received. Perhaps in this case, it is possible to 
use the information available online (price lists 
etc.) and document this in the price 
comparison e.g. with print screens. If not, then 
you need to send out requests. 



Q: One of your project partners asks (WP 
Communication leader): We are in a hurry with 
the project leaflet as I (= the communication 
manager) have been travelling so much 
recently. My brother owns a printing house and 
has offered to do our publication as extra job. 
Could you confirm that the leaflet is ready to 
be printed asap?



A: Sorry, but hurry is no excuse not to follow 
the procurement rules of the project. It’s not 
ok to use the company of your brothers just like 
that – there is a clear conflict of interest case 
there. Of course, your brother’s company can 
participate in an open call for tenders, but then 
you cannot participate in the decision making. 
As the leaflet is ready to be printed and we 
need it quickly, it is best that you check with 
other printing houses near by to select the one 
that offers the best price, quality and delivery 
time at this moment. 



Q: One of your project partners asks: We need 
to buy the budgeted laboratory equipment in 
two parts due to practical reasons. We estimate 
that first delivery will be in December and the 
second in June. Now it seems, that the 
budgeted amount (22.000 €) is enough, we 
might even have some savings. Can we buy the 
first part now, estimated cost is 4.000 € and do 
the procurement later?



A: As the total amount exceeds the 5.000 € and 
you should not artificially split the purchases, 
you need to do the procurement now. It is the 
total amount of the purchase that counts. 
Please, check with the procurement experts in 
your organisation or your FLC if the three 
comparable offers is enough or you need to do 
a national procurement. 


